
Here are some articles and topics that might be similar in content or theme:

1. **"The Politics of Food: Queer Perspectives on Culinary Practices"** - This article could explore
the intersection of queer theory with food practices, examining how culinary traditions reflect and
resist state governance and societal norms.

2. **"Biopower and the State: The Management of Life Through Food"** - An examination of how
states utilize biopower in relation to agricultural policies, public health, and food safety, potentially
connecting with the themes of germ theory and state intervention mentioned in the video.

3. **"Intoxicating Matters: Drugs, Alcohol, and the Politics of Consumption"** - A critical analysis of
how substances like alcohol and narcotics are regulated by the state and how these regulations
relate to societal views on deviance.

4. **"Fermentation and Cultural Identity: A Global Perspective"** - This article could delve into the
cultural significance of fermented foods, examining how they represent both tradition and resistance
within various communities, particularly in queer spaces.

5. **"The Aesthetics of Deviance: Exploring Unruly Food Practices"** - An exploration of how food
practices that deviate from mainstream norms challenge societal perceptions and state regulations,
similar to the discussions in your video about cultural mobility and the perception of fermentation as
both food and "rot".

6. **"Discipline and Deviance: The Role of Hygiene in State Policies"** - This could focus on how
concepts of hygiene and cleanliness are employed by states to regulate bodies and behaviors in
public health initiatives.

7. **“Queer of Color Critique and Food Studies”** - Investigating how queer of color critiques of
power, resistance and identity intersect with food studies, similar to how the video discusses these
elements through archival research.

8. **"Listening to Matter: Analyzing Food as Political Resistance"** - This article could focus on the
notion of "listening" to food and materiality as forms of resistance against dominant state narratives.

9. **"Cultural Politics of Fermentation: From Stinky Tofu to Fine Cheese"** - An analysis of how
taste and cultural preferences regarding fermentation illustrate broader social and political
dynamics.

10. **“The Unruliness of Matter: Non-Human Agency and State Governance”** - A theoretical piece
examining how non-human matter, like bacteria or fermented foods, interacts with state
management and the implications of this interaction for understanding agency.

These suggested articles could provide a scholarly framework that resonates with the themes
discussed in your video, engaging with both historical and contemporary debates on food, deviance,
state power, and materiality.
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